SPILLMAN FARMER ARCHITECTS

1720 SPILLMAN DRIVE, SUITE 200, BETHLEHEM, PA 18015-2169 - 610-865-2621 - FAX 610-865-3236

GENERAL CONTRACTOR Uhrig CClInc Miller Miller Penn Craftsource| AP Houser Klover Serfass Weiss Brucker

BASE BID $1,254,000.00] $1,134,700.00{ $1,408,256.02| $1,138,000.00{ $1,238,000.00| $1,266,700.00{ $1,443,320.00| $1,351,528.00f $1,225,176.00| $1,175,000.00
ALTERNATES $28,900.00 $45,400.00 $9,341.28 $8,500.00 $54,900.00 $29,230.00 $5,454.00 $32,700.00 $17,243.00 $30,000.00
#1 - Delete the Magistrates Office -$45,000.00 -$35,000.00 -$44,688.00 -$45,000.00 -$67,500.00 -$42,000.00 -$58,967.00 -$45,000.00 -$55,817.00 -$51,500.00
#2 - Replace Roof Area A $20,000.00 $21,000.00 $18,820.00 $19,800.00 $27,000.00 $19,200.00 $18,000.00 $24,000.00 $19,000.00 $15,700.00
#3 - Replace Roof Area B $20,000.00 $16,400.00 $14,976.00 $16,000.00 $29,000.00 $15,700.00 $14,400.00 $19,000.00 $15,500.00 $17,000.00
#4 - Replace Roof Area C $20,000.00 $16,500.00 $15,100.00 $16,000.00 $41,000.00 $15,850.00 $14,520.00 $20,000.00 $15,500.00 $33,000.00
#5 - Delete the exterior sign -$2,100.00 -$2,100.00 -$2,277.00 -$2,000.00 -$2,200.00 -$9,300.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $1,890.00 -$4,200.00
#6 - Provide Resinous Flooring in RM 126 $3,000.00 $7,800.00 $4,724.00 $3,000.00 $3,100.00 $3,600.00 $2,946.00 $4,000.00 $2,670.00 $4,000.00
#7 - Provide Metal Lockers from DeBourgh $4,000.00 $5,500.00 $1,249.00 -$4,000.00 $2,500.00 $1,980.00 $1,772.00 No Bid $1,900.00 $3,500.00
#8 - Alternate Door and Hardware Supplier No Bid No Change -$8,488.00 No Bid No Change $10,200.00 -$1,000.00 No Bid No Change No Bid
#9 - Provide the Alternate Resinous Flooring $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,905.28 -$300.00 $9,200.00 $4,400.00 $1,850.00 $1,600.00 $8,700.00 $3,700.00
#10 - Provide the Alt. Resinous Flr. In RM 126 $3,000.00 $8,500.00 $5,914.48 $2,500.00 $10,500.00 $6,400.00 $4,803.00 $5,000.00 $5,700.00 $6,200.00
#11 - Add the Display Case & Pamphlet Rack $3,000.00 $3,800.00 $2,105.52 $2,500.00 $2,300.00 $3,200.00 $3,130.00 $1,600.00 $2,200.00 $2,600.00
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SPILLMAN FARMER ARCHITECTS

1720 SPILLMAN DRIVE, SUITE 200, BETHLEHEM, PA 18015-2169 - 610-865-2621 - FAX 610-865-3236

HEATING CONTRACTOR JBM Master Mech KC Dual Temp | Chris Wolff
BASE BID $410,000.00 $310,293.00 $269,000.00 $252,325.00 $313,900.00
ALTERNATES -$87,441.00 -$53,340.00 $9,000.00 $52,900.00 $45,000.00
#1 - Delete the Magistrates Office
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SPILLMAN FARMER ARCHITECTS

1720 SPILLMAN DRIVE, SUITE 200, BETHLEHEM, PA 18015-2169 - 610-865-2621 - FAX 610-865-3236

PLUMBING CONTRACTOR DeWalt Wolff Dual Temp KC Slatts JBM BASS
BASE BID $83,000 $91,800 $98,200 $137,000 $124,900 $126,000 $86,200
ALTERNATES -$4,000 $3,000 -$3,600 -$2,900 -$3,250 -$4,500 $4,900
#1 - Delete the Magistrate's Office
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SPILLMAN FARMER ARCHITECTS

1720 SPILLMAN DRIVE, SUITE 200, BETHLEHEM, PA 18015-2169 - 610-865-2621 - FAX 610-865-3236

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR Orlando Diefenderfer Albarell wind Gap

BASE BID $273,000 $334,785 $387,917
ALTERNATES -$23,400 -$27,240 $29,707
#1 - Delete the Magistrates Office -$24,000 -$26,700 $27,337
#5 - Delete the exterior sign $600 -$540 $2,370
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